
Boone County Purchasing 
Liz Palazzolo 
Senior Buyer 

613 E. Ash, Room 109 
Columbia, MO 65201 

Phone:(573)886-4392 
Fax: (573) 886-4390 

TO: 
FROM: 
DATE: 
RE: 

NOTICE OF AW ARD MEMORANDUM 

Melinda Bobbitt, Director and File 
Liz Palazzolo, CPPO, C.P.M. 
July 12, 2023 
Award of Four Contracts: C000647, C000648, C000349, and C000652 from 
RFB I 7-12JUN23 -Automotive Supplies Tenn & Supply for the Boone County 
Road & Bridge Department 

Request for Bid I 7-12JUN23 solicited bids for Automotive Supplies for the Boone County Road 
& Bridge Department. Four ( 4) bids were received; please see the attached bid tabulation. All 
four bids will be awarded a contract in order to best meet the needs of Boone County Public 
Works: 

1) Factory Motor Parts of Columbia, Missouri-Awarded Contract C000647 
2) MHC Kenworth of Columbia, Missouri - Awarded Contract C000648 
3) O'Reilly Auto Parts of Springfield, Missouri -Awarded Contract C000649 
4) Advance Auto Parts dba Carquest of Raleigh, North Carolina-Awarded Contract 

C000652 

The initial contract period for each contract will run from the July 15, 2023 through June 30, 
2024. There are four ( 4) one-year renewal options available. 

This is a Tenn and Supply contract. A total $291,000.00 is budgeted in the following referenced 
department/object codes that will be used for payments: 

• 2042 - Road & Bridge Fleet & Equipment Maintenance Operations/ Account 
23035 -Repairs/Maintenance Supplies; 

• 2042 - Road & Bridge Fleet & Equipment Maintenance Operations/ Account 
23037 -Repairs/Shop Supplies; and 

• 2042 - Road & Bridge Fleet & Equipment Maintenance Operations/ Account 
59100 - Vehicle Repairs/Maintenance. 

Attachments: Bid Tabulation 

/Ip 
cc: Robert Sapp 

Contract File 



RFB 17-12JUN23 - Automotive Supplies 

Factory Motor Parts MHC Kenworth General Parts O'Reilly 

Bid Tabulation QTY 
Distribution 

(Carquest) 

Line Item 4.10.1: Discount on Luber Finer filter products 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 41% 

Line Item 4.10.2: Discount on PACCAR filter products 1 No Bid 21.25% No Bid 41% 

Line Item 4.10.3: Oil Filter: Detroit Diesel 10 $ 40.55 $ 48.53 No Bid $ 34.20 

A4711800209 

Detroit DD13 

2019-Current 

Line Item 4.10.4: Oil Filter: Detroit Diesel $ 30.23 $ 53.01 No Bid $ 36.27 

A4731800909 

DetroitDD13 

2012-2018 10 

Line Item 4.10.5: Oil Filter: Paccar $ 34.48 $ 49.36 $ 32.54 $ 41.37 

1948921PE 

Paccar MX13C 

2015 6 

Line Item 4.10.6: Oil Filter: Paccar 6 No Bid $ 54.08 $ 31.84 $ 40.45 

1922496PE 

Paccar MX13C 

2015 

Line Item 4.10.7: Oil Filter: Luber finer 100 $ 6.06 $ 8.29 $ 2.62 $ 5.29 

PH500 

Ford 3.3L 

2017- Current 
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RFB 17-12JUN23 - Automotive Supplies 

Factory Motor Parts MHC Kenworth General Parts O'Reilly 

Bid Tabulation QTY 
Distribution 

(Carquest) 

Line Item 4.10.8: Oil Filter: Luber finer 40 $ 76.60 $ 8.79 $ 2.62 $ 5.29 
PH10063 

GM Trucks 5.3L, 6.0L, 6.6L 

2019- current 

Line Item 4.10.9: Oil Filter: Luber finer 6 $ 13.40 $ 20.61 $ 13.12 $ 15.65 

LFP4836 

John Deere 6130M 

2020-current 

Line Item 4.10.10: Oil Filter: Luber finer 20 $ 15.37 $ 27.02 $ 14.87 $ 18.44 
LFP2051 

Ford F-550 6.7L 

2012- current 

Line Item 4.10.11: Oil Filter: John Deere 15 $ 27.56 $ 50.05 $ 27.64 $ 33.07 

DZ101884 

John Deere 672G 

2017-current 

Line Item 4.10.12: Fuel Filter: Luber finer 15 $ 4.41 $ 32.41 $ 75.59 $ 91.91 

LFF6963 

John Deere 672G 

2017-current 

Line Item 4.10.13: Fuel Filter: Luber finer 15 $ 73.82 $ 122.03 $ 69.29 $ 88.58 

LFF6964 

John Deere 672G 

2017-current 
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RFB 17-12JUN23 -Automotive Supplies 

Factory Motor Parts MHC Kenworth General Parts O'Reilly 

Bid Tabulation QTY 
Distribution 

(Carquest) 

line Item 4.10.14: Fuel Filter: Luber finer 9 $ 59.52 $ 8.59 $ 58.79 $ 72.00 

L4615F 

Ford F550 6. 7L 

2012-current 

line Item 4.10.15: Fuel Filter: Paccar 2 $ 25.09 $ 46.43 $ 37.09 $ 30.11 
K37-1012 

Paccar MX13 

2015 Model 

2012-current 

line Item 4.10.16: Fuel Filter: Paccar 2 $ 27.50 $ 61.00 $ 63.69 $ 53.38 

2277129PE 

Paccar MX13 

2015 Model 

Line Item 4.10.17: Air Filter: Luber finer 40 $ 7.71 No Bid No Bid $ 9.25 

AF6947 

Ford Interceptor Utility 3.3L 

2020-current 

Line Item 4.10.18: Air Filter: Paccar 1 No Bid $ 150.59 No Bid $ 163.14 

Kenworth MX13 

2015 

line Item 4.10.19: Air Filter: Luber finer 10 $ 13.45 No Bid $ 9.44 $ 16.13 

AF9244 

Chevrolet 5.3L 

2019-current 
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RFB 17-12JUN23 - Automotive Supplies 

Factory Motor Parts MHC Kenworth General Parts O'Reilly 

Bid Tabulation QTY 
Distribution 

(Carquest) 

Line Item 4.10.20: Air Filter: Luber finer 12 $ 22.98 $ 39.63 $ 21.69 $ 27.58 

LAF6902 

Ford F-5506.7L 

2012-current 

Line Item 4.10.21:Air Filter: Luber finer 15 $ 57.27 $ 95.06 $ 55.64 $ 68.72 

LAF8669 

John Deere 672G 

2017-current 

Line Item 4.10.22: Hydraulic Filter: Luber finer 4 $ 54.26 $ 91.03 $ 56.69 $ 65.11 

AT335492 

John Deere 672G 

2017-current 

Line Item 4.10.23: Hydraulic Filter: John Deere 4 No Bid $ 103.04 $ 56.69 $ 65.11 

AT367840 

John Deere 672G 

2017-current 

Line Item 4.10.24: Hydraulic Filter: Luber finer 2 $ 32.41 No Bid $ 31.84 $ 38.89 

LFH7221 

John Deere 6130M 

2020-current 

Line Item 4.10.25: Cabin Filter: Luber finer 40 No Bid No Bid $ 7.52 $ 11.89 

CAF10059P 

Ford Interceptor Utility 

2020-current 
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RFB 17-12JUN23 - Automotive Supplies 

Factory Motor Parts MHC Kenworth General Parts O'Reilly 

Bid Tabulation QTY 
Distribution 

(Carquest) 

Line Item 4.10.26: Cabin Filter: Luber finer 40 $ 28.36 $ 22.31 $ 12.59 $ 15.75 

CAF24016 

Freightliner 114SD 

2012-current model 

Line Item 4.10.27: Firm Discount on Motorocraf t Brake 1 34% 69.2308% 0% (See Bid) 41% 

Products 

Line Item 4.10.28: Brake Shoes/Pads 15 $ 73.76 No Bid $ 38.34 $ 82.87 

LlMZ-2001-G (Front) 

Ford Interceptor 

2020Model 

Line Item 4.10.29: Brake Shoes/Pads 15 $ 60.39 No Bid $ 38.34 $ 92.07 

LlMZ-2200-F (Rear) 

Ford Interceptor 

2020Model 

Line Item 4.10.30: Rotors/Drums 30 $ 60.39 No Bid $ 80.59 $ 169.02 

LlMZ-1125-C (Front) 

Ford Interceptor 

2014Model 

Line Item 4.10.31: Rotors/Drums 30 $ 71.58 No Bid $ 58.49 $ 114.59 

L1MZ-2C026-C (Rear) 

Ford Interceptor 

2014 Model 

Line Item 4.10.32: Firm Discount on Gunite Brake Products 1 No Bid 6.1% 0% (See Bid) 41% 
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RFB 17-12JUN23 - Automotive Supplies 

Factory Motor Parts MHC Kenworth General Parts O'Reilly 

Bid Tabulation QTY 
Distribution 

(Carquest) 

Line Item 4.10.33: Rotors/Drums 2 No Bid $ 362.47 $ 246.39 $ 268.40 

9003687X (Balanced) 

Gunite 

Freightliner 

114SD 

Line Item 4.10.34:Rotors/Drums 16 No Bid $ 142.14 $ 207.99 $ 277.36 

3600AX (Balanced) 

Gunite 

F reightl iner 

114SD 

Line Item 4.10.35: Firm Discount on Haldex Brake 1 No Bid 57.75% 50% 41% 

Products 

Line Item 4.10.36: Ai r Brake Chambers/Spring 10 No Bid $ 139.99 $ 117.59 $ 103.18 

GC3030LCW 

Haldex 

Freightliner/Paccar 

Type 30-30 Long Stroke w/ Welded Yoke 

2012-current 

Line Item 4.10.37: Firm Discount on Meritor Brake 1 No Bid No Bid 0% (See Bid) 41% 

Products 
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RFB 17-12JUN23 - Automotive Supplies 

Factory Motor Parts MHC Kenworth General Parts O'Reilly 

Bid Tabulation QTY 
Distribution 

(Carquest) 

Line Item 4.10.38: Brake Shoe Kits with Hardware 2 No Bid No Bid $ 39.99 $ 100.40 

XK2124715QP 

Meritor 

Freightliner 

114SD 

2012-current 

Line Item 4.10.39: Brake Shoe Kits with Hardware 1 No Bid No Bid $ 40.79 $ 111.97 

XK3124711QP 

Meritor 

Freightliner 

114SD 

2016-current 

Qty: 16/order 

Line Item 4.10.40: Firm Discount on Eaton Brake Products 1 No Bid No Bid 0% (See Bid) 41% 

Line ltme 4.10.41: Brake Shoe Kits with Hardware 4 No Bid No Bid $ 93.59 $ 72.28 

4709 23K 

Eaton 

Kenworth T800 

2016 Model 

Line Item 4.10.42: Firm Discount on ANCO Windsheild 1 7(1'/o 25% 0% (See Bid) 41% 

Wiper Products 

Line Item 4.10.43: Windshield Wiper Blades 2 No Bid No Bid $ 15.40 $ 4.50 

A16 (Profile) 

ANCO 
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RFB 17-12JUN23 -Automotive Supplies 

Factory Motor Parts MHC Kenworth General Parts O'Reilly 

Bid Tabulation QTY 
Distribution 

(Carquest) 

Line Item 4.10.44: Windshield Wiper Blades 8 No Bid No Bid $ 15.40 $ 4.50 

A20 (Profile) 

ANCO 

Line Item 4.10.45: Windshield Wiper Blades 95 $ 7.49 No Bid $ 15.40 $ 10.45 

A20 (Profile) 

ANCO 

Line Item 4.10.46: Windshield Wiper Blades 6 $ 7.49 No Bid $ 15.40 $ 10.45 

A24M (Profile) 

ANCO 

Line Item 4.10.47: Windshield Wiper Blades 23 $ 7.49 No Bid $ 15.40 $ 10.45 

A26M (Profile) 

ANCO 

Line Item 4.10.48: Windshield Wiper Blades 1 $ 14.67 $ 6.55 $ 13.39 $ 19.00 

30-16 Winter 

ANCO 

Line Item 4.10.49: Windshield Wiper Blades 9 $ 15.68 $ 8.25 $ 13.39 $ 20.89 

30-22 Winter 

ANCO 

Line Item 4.10.50: Firm Discount on Peterson lights 1 No Bid No Bid 0% (See Bid) 41% 

products 

Line Item 4.10.51: Lamps 6 No Bid No Bid $ 27.61 $ 15.90 

561BR LED 6" Oval 

Stop/Tail/Turn 

Peterson 
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RFB 17-12JUN23 - Automotive Supplies 

Factory Motor Parts MHC Kenworth General Parts O'Reilly 

Bid Tabulation QTY 
Distribution 

(Carquest) 

Line Item 4.10.52:Lamps 2 No Bid No Bid $ 66.29 $ 17.28 

542BR LED 4" Round 

Stop/Tail/Turn 

Peterson 

Line Item 4.10.53: Firm Discount on Blazer lights products 1 No Bid No Bid 0% (See Bid) 41% 

Line Item 4.10.54: Marker Lights 14 No Bid No Bid $ 9.17 $ 8.51 

504BR LED 2.5" RED 

Clearance Marker Light 

Blazer 

Line Item 4.10.55: Marker Lights 8 No Bid No Bid $ 13.16 $ 8.51 

504BR LED 2.5" AMBER 

Clearance Marker Light 

Blazer 

Line Item 4.10.56: Marker Lights 10 No Bid No Bid $ 11.89 $ 7.55 

533BR LED 2" RED 

Clearance Marker Light 

Blazer 

Line Item 4.10.57: Marker Lights 6 No Bid No Bid $ 11.89 $ 7.55 

533BR LED 2" AMBER 

Clearance Marker Light 

Blazer 

Line Item 4.10.58: Back-Up Lights 4 No Bid No Bid $ 61.19 $ 21.01 

561BC LED 611 Oval 

Blazer 
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RFB 17-12JUN23 - Automotive Supplies 

Factory M otor Parts M HC Kenworth General Parts O'Reilly 

Bid Tabulat ion QTY 
Distribution 

(Carquest) 

Line Item 4.10.59: Firm Discount on Splash products 1 13% 16.25% 0% (See Bid) 41% 

Line Item 4.10.60: Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent 60 $ 4.68 $ 2.93 $ 4.13 $4.26 or $4.29 

Pre-Mix Winter See Bid 
1-Gallon 

Splash 

Line Item 4.10.61: Windshield Washer/Antifreeze Solvent 65 $ 2.18 $ 2.93 $ 4.13 $ 4.26 

Pre-Mix Summer 

1-Gallon 

Splash 

Line Item 4.10.62: Firm Discount on 3M products 1 0% (See Bid) 0% (See Bid) 50% 41% 

Line Item 4.10.63: Brake-Cleaner 328 $ 2.80 $ 3.25 $ 10.38 $ 4.26 

High Power 

Minimum 14-oz can 

3M 

Line Item 4.10.64: Firm Discount all other manufacturer 1 0% (See Bid) 20"/o 35%-65% 41% 

products 

Line Item 4.11.1: 1st Renewal Period Increase 5% 0%-See Bid 5% 41% 

Percentage 

Line Item 4.11.2: 2nd Renewal Period Increase 5% 0%-See Bid 5% 41% 

Percentage 

Line Item 4.11.3: 3rd Renewal Period Increase 5% 0%-See Bid 5% 41% 

Percentage 
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RFB 17-12JUN23 - Automotive Supplies 

Factory Motor Parts MHC Kenworth General Parts O'Reilly 

Bid Tabulation QTY 
Distribution 

(Carquest) 

Lilne Item 4.11.4: 4th Renewal Period Increase 5% 0%-See Bid 5% 41% 

Percentage 
CO-Op - Yes Or No Yes No Yes Yes 
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